
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices Vendor Number: 1644549 Vendor
Name: 3003 Corporate Hotel LLC

Check Details:
Check Number: 0346947 Check Amount: $ 4,055.76 Check Date:
12/9/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 1764093608 Invoice Date: 11/25/2025 PO Number:
B0002875 Voucher Number: V0915379

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below
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Tue, Nov 25, 2025 at 06:06 PM UTC

Nicole Thomason <Nicole.Thomason@Hilton.com>

[External] DoubleTree Lisle INV 1764093608

 <Nicole.Thomason@Hilton.com>Nicole Thomason

CC: Junokas, Molly <junokasm@cod.edu>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hello,

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

  

      

 630-505-0900     Hotel



 

 

This transmission is not a digital or electronic signature and cannot be used to form, document, or 
authenticate a contract. Hilton and its affiliates accept no liability arising in connection with this 
transmission. Copyright 2025 Hilton Proprietary and Confidential 





B0002875
05-60-11301-5501002
263 Special Event
NONE

















Wed, Dec 3, 2025 at 10:31 PM UTC

"Junokas, Molly" <junokasm@cod.edu>

DoubleTree Lisle INV 1760019089

"Junokas, Molly" <junokasm@cod.edu>

CC:

BCC:

Hello,

 

Please process.

 

Thanks!

 

Molly Junokas

Business Manager

McAninch Arts Center, College of DuPage

 | 630-942-2938junokasm@cod.edu

she/her

 

From: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu> 
 Wednesday, December 3, 2025 4:30 PMSent:

 Junokas, Molly <junokasm@cod.edu>To:
 FW: [External] DoubleTree Lisle INV 1760019089Subject:



 

Hi Molly,

 

This was not received in Chrome River.  I checked twice.

Can you forward to ?invoicing@cod.edu

 

 

Thank you

 

Marivic Zerrudo

Accounts Payable Specialist

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

phone 630-942-2601 l zerrudom@cod.edu

 

From: Junokas, Molly < > junokasm@cod.edu
 Wednesday, December 3, 2025 4:23 PMSent:

 Zerrudo, Marivic < >To: zerrudom@cod.edu
 FW: [External] DoubleTree Lisle INV 1760019089Subject:

 

Hi Marivic,

 



Looks like this Hilton invoice may have been missed. It was sent to invoicing on 10/09/25. Can 
you please route to me in Chrome River when you get a chance?

 

B0002875

GL to use is 05-60-11301-5501002

 

Thank you,

 

Molly Junokas

Business Manager

McAninch Arts Center, College of DuPage

 | 630-942-2938junokasm@cod.edu

she/her

 

From: Nicole Thomason < > Nicole.Thomason@Hilton.com
 Thursday, October 9, 2025 9:23 AMSent:

 Invoicing < >To: invoicing@cod.edu
 Hopper, Joe < >; Junokas, Molly < >Cc: hopper@cod.edu junokasm@cod.edu

 [External] DoubleTree Lisle INV 1760019089Subject:

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with 
sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



 

Hello,

 

Attached is invoice 176019089.

Thank you and have a great day 

 

Kind regards,

 

Nicole Thomason

Credit Manager/ Accounts Receivable

 

 

DoubleTree by Hilton Lisle Naperville

3003 Corporate West Drive

Lisle, IL 60532



 

+1 630-245-7634    Direct

+1 630-505-0900    Hotel

 

 

 

This transmission is not a digital or electronic signature and cannot be used to form, document, or authenticate a contract. Hilton and its affiliates accept no 

liability arising in connection with this transmission. Copyright 2025 Hilton Proprietary and Confidential
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